
Item No Description Brand Preference UOM Manufacturer Part # Price Manufacturer Part # Price

1 CQSEA Picked up by WCRC at 
Vendor Source

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 1.45$       MPM CQSEA 1.50$       

2 CQSEA Delivered to WCRC 
designated site by Vendor

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 1.59$       MPM CQSEA 1.68$       

3 CM-90 Picked up by WCRC at 
Vendor Source

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 3.20$       NO BID

4 CM-90 Delivered to WCRC 
designated site by Vendor

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 3.34$       NO BID

5 CM-300 Picked up by WCRC at 
Vendor Source

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 4.00$       NO BID

6 CM-300 Delivered to WCRC 
designated site by Vendor

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 4.14$       NO BID 

7 RPE Picked up by WCRC at Vendor 
Source

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 3.80$       NO BID

8 RPE Delivered to WCRC designated 
site by Vendor

All Brands are acceptable Gallon 3.94$       NO BID

9 Demurrage All Brands are acceptable Hourly Rate 150.00$  MPM 110.00$  
10 Return Freight Price All Brands are acceptable Gallon 0.21$       MPM 0.27$       
11 Unloading Time All Brands are acceptable Minute 240.00$  MPM 180.00$  
12 Required Cancellation All Brands are acceptable Hour 4.00$       MPM 6.00$       
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