

BIDS RECEIVED FOR 2025 CHIPSEAL AGGREGATES

Opened online through BidNet 11/18/2024

Description	UOM	Stoneco of Michigan	Farmer & Underwood	Midwestern Materials LLC	Osburn Industries
			Price	Price	Price
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 1/Main Yard)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.75	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 2/Southeast Service Center)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 3/Chelsea Yard)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 52.50	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 3/Otto Pit)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 53.45	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 3/McCabe Pit)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 52.50	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 4/Manchester Yard)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 53.45	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 4/Boelter Pit)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 53.45	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 1)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 6/Northeast)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.75	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 6/Gale Pit)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.75	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00
CS-2 Trap Rock (District 6/Salem Yard)	Ton	No Bid	\$ 51.75	\$ 48.48	\$ 49.00