
Aggregate 
Industries

Farmer & 
Underwood

Osburn Industries, 
Inc.

Stoneco of 
Michigan

Last Year

Item Code Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
23A $15.93 $15.83 $18.80/$17.80 $17.90 $15.18
23A $15.23 $15.13 $17.00/$16.00 $16.55 $14.48
23A $17.31 $17.21 $18.80/$17.80 $18.90 $16.56
23A $16.62 $16.52 $18.80/$17.80 $18.90 $15.87
23A $16.62 $16.52 $18.80/$17.80 $18.40 $15.87

Item Code Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
21A $16.28 $15.83 $19.00/$18.00 $17.30 $15.18
21A $15.58 $15.13 $17.25/$16.25 $16.05 $14.48
21A $17.66 $17.21 $19.00/$18.00 $18.20 $16.56
21A $16.97 $16.52 $19.00/$18.00 $18.20 $15.87
21A $16.97 $16.52 $19.00/$18.00 $17.90 $15.87

Item Code Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
6A $18.79 $19.03 $21.50/$20.50 $28.50 $17.27
6A $18.08 $18.33 $20.00/$19.00 $27.25 $16.58
6A $20.16 $20.41 $21.50/$20.50 $29.40 $18.62
6A $19.47 $19.72 $21.50/$20.50 $29.40 $17.93
6A $19.47 $19.72 $21.50/$20.50 $29.10 $17.93

Item Code Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
4A $16.23 $16.78 $19.25/$18/25 NO BID $15.47
4A $15.58 $16.08 $17.50/$16.50 NO BID $14.79
4A $17.66 $18.16 $19.25/$18/25 NO BID $16.82
4A $16.97 $17.47 $19.25/$18/25 NO BID $16.14
4A $16.97 $17.47 $19.25/$18/25 NO BID $16.14
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2022 Limestone Products Bid

Bid Item List - 23A

Description
District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi)
District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta)
District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima)
District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester Bridgewater)
District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior

Bid Item List - 21A
Description
District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi)
District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta)
District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima)
District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater)
District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior)

Bid Item List - 6A
Description
District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi)
District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta)
District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima)
District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater)
District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior)

Bid Item List - 4A
Description
District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi)
District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta)
District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima)
District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater)
District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior)

Low



Aggregate 
Industries

Farmer & 
Underwood

Osburn Industries, 
Inc.

Stoneco of 
Michigan

Last Year

Item Code Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Ohio #2 District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi) NO BID $16.78 $19.25/$18.25 $19.15 $15.47
Ohio #2 District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta) $15.58 $16.08 $17.50/$16.50 $17.90 $14.79
Ohio #2 District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima) $17.66 $18.16 $19.25/$18.25 $20.05 $16.82
Ohio #2 District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater) $16.97 $17.47 $19.25/$18.25 $20.05 $16.14
Ohio #2 District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior) $16.97 $17.47 $19.25/$18.25 $19.75 $16.14

Item Code Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Plain Rip-Rap District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi) NO BID $33.51 $37.00/$36.00 $41.15 $29.94
Plain Rip-Rap District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta) $31.73 $32.73 $36.00/$35.00 $40.25 $29.17
Plain Rip-Rap District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima) $34.09 $35.09 $37.00/$36.00 $42.75 $31.49
Plain Rip-Rap District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater) $33.30 $34.30 $37.00/$36.00 $41.50 $30.71
Plain Rip-Rap District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior) $33.30 $34.30 $37.00/$36.00 $41.75 $30.71

Item Code Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Heavy Rip-Rap District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi) $32.51 $33.51 $38.00/$37.00 $43.15 $29.94
Heavy Rip-Rap District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta) $31.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.17
Heavy Rip-Rap District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima) $34.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.38
Heavy Rip-Rap District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater) $33.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.35
Heavy Rip-Rap District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior) $33.30 $34.30 $38.00/$37.00 $43.75 $30.71

Item Code Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
4X8 Limestone District 1 (Webster, Scio, Lodi) NO BID $23.78 $28.00/$27.00 $26.00 $22.67
4X8 Limestone District 2 (Pittsfield, Ypsilanti) District 5 (Saline, York, Augusta) $23.08 $23.08 $27.00/$26.00 $24.75 $21.54
4X8 Limestone District 3 (Dexter, Lyndon, Sylvan, Lima) $25.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.78
4X8 Limestone District 4 (Freedom, Sharon, Manchester, Bridgewater) $24.47 $24.47 $28.00/$27.00 $26.90 $23.96
4X8 Limestone District 6 (Salem, Northfield, Ann Arbor, Superior) $24.47 $24.47 $28.00/$27.00 $26.60 $23.54
Low
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2022 Limestone Products Bid

Bid Item List - Plain Rip-Rap

Bid Item List - Heavy Rip-Rap

Bid Item List - 4X8 Limestone

Bid Item List - Ohio #2
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