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Inc.

Last Year

Item Code Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Grit Main Yard NO BID $15.25 $13.65
Grit Southeast Service Center NO BID $15.25 $16.17
Grit Chelsea Yard NO BID $15.25 $13.35
Grit Manchester Yard NO BID $15.25 $13.65
Grit Northeast Service Center NO BID $16.00 $15.75
2ns Sand Main Yard $13.50 $14.00 $12.00
2ns Sand Southeast Service Center $13.50 $14.00 $12.00
2ns Sand Chelsea Yard $13.50 $14.00 $12.00
2ns Sand Manchester Yard $13.50 $14.00 $12.00
2ns Sand Northeast Service Center $13.50 $14.00 $12.00
Low
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