
BIDS RECEIVED FOR LIQUID
ASPHALTIC MATERIALS

  
Price/Gal. Price/Gal. Demurrage Return Unloading Cancel 
Picked Up Delivered Price per Hr. Price Time Notice

CQSEA 1.3000 1.4215 110.00 0.1823           180 min 4 hrs
 CM-90 2.3800 2.5150 110.00 0.1823           180 min 4 hrs
CM-300 2.9000 3.0315 110.00 0.1823           180 min 4 hrs
CQSEA NO BID   
BM-90P 2.9000 2.950 105.000 1,914.00        120 MINUTES 5 HOURS
CM-300 NO BID  

CQSEA 1.3300 1.500 100.00

 No return 
allowed for fog 

seal. 
 120 minutes  1.5 hours 

 CM-90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

CM-300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
 SS1H 1.9500 3.000 90.00 .1967 Gal 180 min 4 hrs
 CM-90 2.3500 2.4811 90.00 .1967 Gal 180 min 4 hrs
CM-300 2.8500 2.9811 90.00 .1967 Gal 180 min 4 hrs
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Pugmill use 3.00 per ton.
Mobilization $550 each

In lieu of CM-90, bidding an 
alternate - BM-90p, 5800 gal 
min.

Cancellations not made in 
required time frame are 
$350 charge. Pumps may 
not be available on tanker 
and if required may be $50 
charge. Pick up at vendor 
can be arranged.
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