BIDS RECEIVED FOR LUBRICATING OILS

02/21/2018

BIDDERS

Briner

Shrader Tire & QOil Co Superflite Oil Crystal Flash

Bulk Oils Price per Gallon Price per Gallon Price per Gallon Price per Gallon
Ann Arbor

15W-40 $8.42 $9.29 $5.95 $6.89
Trans/Hyd $8.41 $6.79 $5.10 $5.99
Southeast

15W-40 $8.42 $9.29 $5.95 $6.89
Trans/Hyd $8.41 $6.79 $5.10 $5.99
Northeast
Trans/Hyd $8.41 $6.79 $5.10 $5.99

Gear Lubes/Auto Trans

TO 4/10W Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $35.58 $44.69 $43.75 $64.95
16 Gal NO BID NO BID $130.00 NO BID
55 Gal $373.20 $459.75 $359.00 $499.95

TO4/30 W Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $35.58 $44.69 $43.75 $64.95
16 Gal NO BID NO BID $130.00 NO BID
55 Gal $373.20 $459.75 $359.00 $499.95

TO 4/50 W Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $42.00 $44.69 $52.25 $64.95
16 Gal NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID
55 Gal $373.20 $459.75 $455.00 $499.95

85 W 140 Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $43.80 $71.40 $41.75 $79.95
16 Gal $203.40 $239.47 $146.00 $239.95
55 Gal $479.87 $784.89 $436.00 $689.95

50W Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $78.90 $145.29 $79.50 $159.95




16 Gal $270.00 $492.80 $272.00 $369.95
55 Gal $690.00 $1,629.33 $865.00 $1,189.95
Dexron Il ATF Price per container Price per container Price per container Price per container
5 Gal $35.10 NO BID $34.50 $59.95
16 Gal NO BID NO BID $107.00 NO BID
55 Gal $383.49 $669.89 $289.00 $399.95
Drum Deposit: $S0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00
Product/Brand: Starfire Chevron Delo Warren Coastal TOTAL & DA
Hose Reel $1,093.29 $664.25 NO BID $775.00
Hose $233.56 $152.49 NO BID $179.00
Dispenser $407.85 $213.00 NO BID $225.00
Dispenser $965.81 $402.45 NO BID $525.00
Pump $965.29 $504.19 NO BID $585.00
Installation NO BID $750.00 NO BID 75/hr + addl material cost
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